
From: April Martinig aprilmartinig@hotmail.com
Subject: Re: Invoice for $1600 USD

Date: February 12, 2016 at 12:07 PM
To: Alouatta Sanctuary Panama alouatta.sanctuary@gmail.com

That wasn’t obvious. So, I am glad that has been cleared up. I will ask Ben for one when he returns and if we have any questions, I will happily 
email you both once more.

---
April Martinig
M.Sc. in Biology
martinig.weebly.com
“I do not accept the conventional order of things as a given."

On Feb 11, 2016, at 9:07 PM, Alouatta Sanctuary Panama <alouatta.sanctuary@gmail.com> wrote:

April, again, we do our invoicing through PayPal. You paid in person therefore the person you paid can give you an invoice. That's usually 
how invoicing goes. Ben can easily make something for your records. 

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 11, 2016, at 2:55 PM, April Martinig <aprilmartinig@hotmail.com> wrote:

Hi Jolie and Seth,

I just wanted to ask again for my invoice for $1600 USD. It’s for having paid $1600 USD to Ben (project manager) immediately upon my 
arrival at the Sanctuary on February 7th, 2016. I require an invoice for my records. Please provide me with one soon.

Thank you in advance,
---
April Martinig
M.Sc. in Biology
martinig.weebly.com
“I do not accept the conventional order of things as a given."
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